
GAT-B Arts, Humanities & Social Science Verbal

Sr Questions Answers Choice

1
Choose the Word Which has Opposite Meaning
Abandonment

A. Cessation
B. Stoppage
C. Halt
D. Compare
E. Extension

2
Complete Sentence
Let us wait .....................

A. So little
B. Little
C. A little
D. The little

3
Complete Sentence
The successful ................. of a novel or a poem requires fluency in two languages.

A. Publications
B. Reproduction
C. Writing
D. Translation

4
Complete Sentence
We need more then of culture and enlightenment, we have too many .............. among us.

A. Students
B. Philistines
C. Philosophers
D. Visionaries

5
Complete Sentence
Stand here, ............ I speak.

A. While
B. As
C. When
D. The time

6

Complete Sentence
The committee censured the member, noting that his behaviour was the very ........... of ethical condu
ct.

A. Essence
B. Embodiment
C. Nature
D. Antithesis

7

Complete Sentence
Studded starfish are well protected from most predators and parasites by .......... surface whose stud
s are actually modified spines.

A. A fragile
B. An obtuse
C. An armoured
D. A brittle

8
Complete Sentence
Raheela spoke ................. that it was applauded by all.

A. Well
B. As well
C. Very well
D. So well

9

Complete Sentence
In many countries, the proponents of a centrally controlled economy, although in ............... continue
to constitute a powerful political force.

A. Control
B. Restart
C. Disarray
D. Error

10
Complete Sentence
Haider is either a scholar ................. a professional teacher.

A. Else
B. or else
C. Or
D. And

11

Complete Sentence
The candidate later ............. the broad generalization concerning welfare recipients by noting that th
e vast majority are not able to find significant employment.

A. Verified
B. Qualified
C. Withdrew
D. Clarified

12
Complete Sentence
The evil of class and race hatred must be eliminated while it is still in an ............. state.

A. Independent
B. Amorphous
C. Embryonic
D. Uncultivated

13

Complete Sentence

Maria has been waiting for you ................... morning.

A. Till
B. From
C. For
D. Since

14

Complete Sentence
In their most recent report to the shareholders, the directors ................ financial information on inter
national sales.

A. Distort
B. Omit
C. Invent
D. Substitute



15
Complete Sentence
The dog is ............. faithful animal.

A. The
B. Not
C. A
D. Very

16
Complete Sentence
They fired upon the enemy form behind the trees, walls and any other ........... point they could find.

A. Vantage
B. Indefensible
C. Exposed
D. Definitive

17

Complete Sentence
By the middle of January, the river had become so choked with ice as to be ............. even for the sm
allest of boats.

A. Inactive
B. Unreliable
C. Impassable
D. Unattractive

18
Complete Sentence
take any apple ............... you like.

A. What
B. As
C. Which
D. That

19

Complete Sentence
This state is a colony, however, in most matters, it is ........... and receives no order form the mother 
country.

A. Distant
B. Autonomous
C. Submissive
D. Amorphous

20
Complete Sentence
I have come to see the loss, I wont see any one ...............

A. Except
B. Else
C. Or else
D. Other

21

Complete Sentence
Those defenders of the tobacco industry who deny that there is a casual linkage between cigarette s
moking and many diseases all but ........... the statistical evidence that very clearly demonstrates the
connection.

A. Ignor
B. Signifty
C. Explain
D. Refute

22
Complete Sentence
He worked ......... because he aspired to stand first in the examination.

A. Very hard
B. Harder
C. Much hard
D. The harder

23

Complete Sentence
To the ambassador, who believed that some measure of ................ should always characterize junio
r staffers, the new aid seemed very presumptuous.

A. Energy
B. Integrity
C. Humility
D. Sincerity

24

Complete Sentence
After having worked in the soup kitchen feeding the hungry, the volunteer began to see her own good 
fortune as a ...................

A. Threat
B. Fluke
C. Omen
D. Reward

25
Complete Sentence
Saima ............... my name from across the river.

A. Cried
B. Called
C. Cried out
D. Shouted

26
Complete Sentence
The members of the religious sect ostracized the ................. who had abandoned their faith.

A. Recreant
B. Coward
C. Suppliant
D. Litigant

27

Complete Sentence
The legal system of Russia can no longer regard itself as ............. and standing apart from those of 
other countries.

A. Damaging
B. Arbitary
C. Binding
D. Independent

28
Complete Sentence
Train is ............... of different bogeys.

A. Made of
B. Make up of
C. Made with
D. Made up

29

Complete Sentence
Faced with these massive changes, the government keeps its own counsil, although generally benev
olent, it has always been ............. regime.

A. Reticent
B. Indifferent
C. Altruistic
D. Unpredictable

30
Complete Sentence
................... is a person who dabbles in art and letters.

A. Philosopher
B. Philistine
C. Chauvinist
D. Dilettante

Complete Sentence



31

Complete Sentence
For Amna, each new school year was an ............ experience, but her brother awaited the coming of 
autumn with dread.

A. Exhausting
B. Illuminating
C. Exciting
D. Exhilarauing

32

Complete Sentence
Usman is not attracted by the peripatetic life of the ............ always wandering through the countrysid
e.

A. Vagabond
B. Mendicant
C. Almsgiver
D. Philosopher

33
Complete Sentence
Work hard lest you ............. fail.

A. Will
B. Should
C. Can
D. Should not

34

Complete Sentence
The supposedly impregnable defenses of the country southern border became ............ when the offic
e discovered that the defenses could be circumvented by an approach from the east.

A. Useless
B. Flexibel
C. Valuable
D. Worthless

35
Complete Sentence
In the world of today, material values take precedence ............. spiritual values.

A. Over
B. At
C. On
D. About

36
Complete Sentence
His ................... tactics may compel me to cancel the contract as the job must be finished on time.

A. Offensive
B. Dilatory
C. Infamous
D. Confiscatory

37
Complete Sentence
Wooden surface was glued ................. the steel surface.

A. Within
B. Against
C. Onto
D. Into

38

Complete Sentence
Traffic speed limits are set at a level that achieves some balance between the danger of ................ s
peed and the desire of most people to travel as quickly as possible.

A. Excessive
B. Prudent
C. Marginal
D. Normal

39

Complete Sentence
Despite the fact that Nadia was much ............... the scientist continued to present her controversial 
theory to the public.

A. Imitated
B. Chastened
C. Maligned
D. Admired

40
Complete Sentence
.............. the event of Aslam resigning his job, his family would starve.

A. In
B. On
C. At
D. Within

41
Complete Sentence
Overindulgence ............. character as well as physical stamina.

A. Maintains
B. Debilitates
C. Stimulates
D. Strengthens

42

Complete Sentence
Because if arrives so early in the season, before many other birds, the robin has been called the ......
............. of spring.

A. Compass
B. Harbinger
C. Autocrat
D. Hostage

43
Complete Sentence
So many servants attended ............. him during his illness.

A. On
B. With
C. At
D. Upon

44
Complete Sentence
Milk is a ............. food.

A. Wholesome
B. Nutritious
C. Health giving
D. Pure

45

Complete Sentence
Although, alcoholism has long been regarded as a personality disorder, there is evidence to suggest 
that alcoholics are often the children of alcoholics and that they are born with a ................. the disea
se.

A. Deterioration of&nbsp;
B. Respect for
C. Liability for
D. Predisposition to

46
Complete Sentence
I do not think, you will gain anything by insulting and ................. the man you do not agree with.

A. Depicting
B. Revamping
C. Defaming
D. Charging

Complete Sentence
We must try to understand his momentary aberration for Ashraf has ................. more strain and anx

A. Undergone
B. Forgotten



47 We must try to understand his momentary aberration for Ashraf has ................. more strain and anx
iety than any among us.

B. Forgotten
C. Described
D. Understood

48

Complete Sentence
Contrary to popular belief, they were not peace-loving astronomers but ............... warriors who viewe
d their gods as cruel and vengeful.

A. Reluctant
B. Amicable
C. Skilled
D. Formidable

49

Complete Sentence
His true feelings .................... themselves in his sarcastic asides; only then was his bitterness reve
aled.

A. Developed
B. Concealed
C. Manifested
D. Grieved

50
Complete Sentence
His answer was such ............. I expected him to give.

A. As
B. Like
C. Which
D. That


